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Time Monday – 2
nd

 Sep Tuesday – 3
rd

 Sep Wednesday – 4
th

 Sep Thursday – 5
th

 Sep Friday – 6
th

 Sep 

09.00 – 9.30  

Library time / 
Meeting with Tutor/ 
Placement meeting 
with Practice Teacher 

   

9.30 – 10.00 
 
 

   

10.00 – 10.30 Welcome Back and 
Introduction  (joint 
session with Junior 
Sophisters)  (Stan 
Houston) Robert Emmet 
Theatre (Arts 2037 

Preparation for 
placement: A model of 
reflexivity (joint session 
with Junior Sophister 
students) (Stan Houston) 
Thomas Davis Theatre 
(Arts 2043) 
 
 

Preparation for 
placement: Critical 
thinking in social work 
(joint session with Junior 
Sophisters) (Stan 
Houston)  
Jonathan Swift Theatre 
(Arts 2041A).   

Domestic Violence.  
Guest Speaker: Cathy 
Humphreys, University 
of Melbourne 
(Joint session with 
Junior Sophister 
students) 
Robert Emmet Theatre 
(Arts 2037)  

10.30 – 11.00  

11.00 – 11.30 

11.30 – 12.00 Library Time  

12.00 – 12.30 

Lunch  

12.30 – 13.00 

Lunch 

13.00 – 13.30 
Preparation for 
Placement: Models of 
reflection (joint session 
with Junior Sophisters) 
(Stan Houston) 
Jonathan Swift Theatre 
(Arts 2041A).   

Lunch  Lunch  Lunch  

13.30 – 14.00 
Preparation for 
placement: 
Understanding and 
applying social work 
process (joint session 
with Junior 
Sophisters) (Stan 
Houston) Thomas 
Davis Theatre (Arts 
2043) 

14.00 – 14.30  

Library time / Meeting 
with Tutor/Placement 
meeting with Practice 
Teacher 

Library time /Meeting 
with Tutor/Placement 
meeting with Practice 
Teacher 

 

14.30 – 15.00  

15.00 – 15.30   

15.30 – 16.00    


